
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
COUNTY OF KITTITAS 

STATE OF WASHINGTON 

RESOLUTI°.tJ.r2 
NO. ~I ?1 ---~ 

TO AWARD THE BID TO FURNISH WEED SPRAY MATERIALS FOR 2013 

WHEREAS: A Notice of Call for Bids was approved and signed on February 19, 2013, for 
Weed Spray Materials for 2012; and 

WHEREAS: Sealed bids were opened on March 6, 2013, at 2:00 p.m. in the Kittitas County 
Public Works and three (3) bids were received; and 

WHEREAS: The Public Works Department recommends that the responsible bid of Helena 
Chemical Company be accepted; and 

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of County Commissioners, in the best 
interest of the public, does hereby award the bid for 2013 Weed Spray Materials to Helena 
Chemical Company, upon such terms and conditions as specified in the Proposal submitted by 
said bidder( s). 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Public Works is authorized to sign the 
contract documents upon such terms and conditions specified in the Proposal submitted by said 
bidder(s). 

DATED this 19th day of March, 2013, at Ellensburg, Washington. 

Attest: 

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
KITTITAS COUNTY, WASHINGTON 

PGur~ 
Obie O'Brien, Chair 

~ir 
GarY Beriidi,lCommissioner 



BID PROPOSAL CHEMICAUWEED SPRAY - BID OPENING MARCH 6, 2013, AT 2:00 P.M. 

CHEMICAL INGREDIENTS 
Active 

ESTIMATED QTY. 
CONTAINER 

COST 
TOTAL UNIT 

Ingredients % SIZE COST 

RESIDUALS 

Velossa Hexazinone 25.00% 375 Gal. 30 Gal. $80.44 $30,165.00 

(No Substitutions) Inert Ingrediants 75.00% 

EsplAnade Indaziflam 19.05%10 0 oz Gal. $1,018.28 $7,952.77 

(No Substitutions) Other Ingredients 80.95% 7.81 Gal. 2.5 Gal. 

Perspective Aminocyclopyrachlor 39.50%30 0 oz 80 oz $4.60 $13,800.00 

(No Substitutions) Chlorsulfuron 15.80% 

Other Ingredients 44.70% 

CONTACT & SELECTIVE HERBICIDES 

Brush Rhap 
3, 6-dlctJloro-methyoxybenzoic 

Acid 18.28% 750 Gal. 265 Gal. $49.73 $37,297.50 

(No Substitutions) 2,4-dichloro-phenoxyacetic Acid 24.62% 

Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl) 
Glyphosate glycine, in the form of its 

isopropylamine salt 41% 30 Gal. 30 Gal. $14.00 $420.00 

(No Substitutions) Other Ingredients 59% 

Triisoprapanolammonium salt of 2-
Milestone pyridine carboxylic acid, 4-amino 3, 

6-dichloro An enOl 'In Gal. ,,<:: Gal. ct')QQ 7~ $5,994.60 .... u .uv/o .... v L.V ..., .... vv •• v 

(No Substitutions) Other Ingredients 59.40% 

SURFACTANTS 
Propietary blend of Aliphatic 

Grounded Hydrocarbons & hexahydric 
Alcohol, ethoylate and fatty acids 99.00% 150 Gal. 2.5 Gal. $16.40 $2,460.00 

(No Substitutions) Components ineffective as adjuvalll 1.00% 

Patent No. 5,906,961 

TOTAL- $98,089.87 

**NOTE: A CURRENT LABEL AND MSDS SHEET FOR EACH CHEMICAL SHALL BE SUPPLIED WHEN SUBMITIING A BID. 

Helena Chemical Co. 

Company Name 

900 N. Nelson SI. • Ste 8 509-961-2621 

Company Address Telephone No. 

S~okane, VVA 99202 509-465-4058 

City State Zip Fax No. 



BID PROPOSAL CHEMICALIWEED SPRAY - BID OPENING NOVEMBER 30, 2011, AT 2:00 P.M. 

CHEMICAL INGREDIENTS 
Active ESTIMATED QTY. 

CONTAINER 
COST 

TOTAL UNIT 
Ingredients % SIZE COST 

RESIDUALS 

Velossa Hexazinone 25.00% 375 Gal. Gal. No Bid 
(No Substitutions) Inert Ingrediants 75.00% 

EsplAnade Indaziflam 19.Q5O~~ rc>J OZ 320 oz $7.95 $7,950.00 
(No Substitutions) Other Ingredients 80.95% 

p ' 
2.5 Gal. $1,017.60 

Perspective Aminocyclopyrachlor 39 .50~<§ ~ oz 80 oz $4.60 $13,800.00 
(No Substitutions) Chlorsulfuron 15.80% 

Other Ingredients 44.70% 

CONTACT & SELECTIVE HERBICIDES 

Brush Rhap 
3, ~d ichl()ro·methyoxybenzOic 

Acid 18.28% 750 Gal. Gal. No Bid 
(No Substitutions) 2,4-dichloro-phenoxyacetic Acid 24.62% 

Glyphosate 
Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl) 

glycine, in the form of its 
isopropylamine salt 41% 30 Gal. Gal. $12.95 $388.50 

(No Substitutions) Other Ingredients 59% 
Triisoprapanolammonium salt of 2-

Milestone pyridine carboxylic acid, 4-amino 3, 
6-dichloro 40.60% 20 Gal. 2.5 Gal. $299.73 $5,994.60 

(No Substitutions) Other Ingredients 59.40% 

SURFACTANTS 
Propletary blen'~ of AliphatiC 

Grounded Hydrocarbons & hexahydric 
Alcohol, ethoylate and fatty acids 99.00% 150 Gal. Gal. No Bid 

(No Substitutions) Components ineffective as adjuvari 1.00% 

Patent No. 5,906,961 

TOTAL- $20,183.10 
**NOTE: A CURRENT LABEL AND MSDS SHEET FOR EACH CHEMICAL SHALL BE SUPPLIED WHEN SUBMITTING A BID. 

Wilbur-Ellis Co. 

Company Name 

7 East Washington Ave. 509-669-2636 

Telephone No. 

Yakima, WA 98903 509-663-5192 

City State Zip Fax No. 



BID PROPOSAL CHEMICALIWEED SPRAY - BID OPENING NOVEMBER 30, 2011, AT 2:00 P.M. 

CHEMICAL INGREDIENTS 
Active ESTIMATED QTY. 

CONTAINER 
COST 

TOTAL UNIT 
Ingredients % SIZE COST 

RESIDUALS 

Velossa Hexazinone 25.00% 375 Gal. Gal. No Bid 
(No Substitutions) Inert Ingrediants 75.00% 

EsplAnade Indaziflam 19.05%\0 0 oz Oz. $7.95 $7,950.00 

(No Substitutions) Other Ingredients 80.95% 2.5 Gal. 

Perspective Aminocyclopyrachlor 39'50%~ 0 oz oz $4.60 $13,800.00 

(No Substitutions) Chlorsulfuron 15.80% 

Other Ingredients 44.70% 

CONTACT & SELECTIVE HERBICIDES 

Brush Rhap 
3.6-dlct:lloro-memyoxyoenzolc 

Acid 18.28% 750 Gal. Gal. No Bid 
(No Substitutions) 2,4-dichloro-phenoxyacetic Acid 24.62% 

Glyphosate 
Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl) 

glycine, in the form of its 
isopropylamine salt 41% 30 Gal. 30 Gal. $14.30 $429.00 

(No Substitutions) Other Ingredients 59% 

Triisoprapanolammonium salt of 2-

Milestoiie PYiidine caiboxylic acid 1 4-amino 3 1 

6-dichloro 40.60% 20 Gal. 2.5 Gal. $299.73 $5,994.60 

(No Substitutions) Other Ingredients 59.40% 

SURFACTANTS 
I-'ropletary oleno ot Aliptlatlc 

Grounded Hydrocarbons & hexahydric 
Alcohol, ethoylate and fatty acids 99.00% 150 Gal. Gal. No Bid 

(No Substitutions) Components ineffective as a.dJuvan 1.00% 

Patent No. 5,906,961 

TOTAL- $28,173.60 

""NOTE: A CURRENT LABEL AND MSDS SHEET FOR EACH CHEMICAL SHALL BE SUPPLIED WHEN SUBMITTING A BID. 

Crop Production Services, Inc. 

Company Name 

328 7th Ave. 503-703-6315 

Company Address Telephone No. 

Seaside, OR 97138 503-717-1418 

City State Zip Fax No. 


