KITTITAS COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

AGENDA STAFF REPORT

AGENDA DATE: December 6, 2016

ACTION REQUESTED: Approve a Resolution to Award the bid to

furnish Snow & Ice Control Products for 2017.

BACKGROUND: Kittitas County Public Works went out to bid for

the furnishing of specific snow & ice products in accordance with specifications. Bid packets were sent out to businesses in the area that

provide these products.

Bids were opened on November 17, 2016, at

2:00 p.m. Six (6) bids were received.

INTERACTION: Public Works

RECOMMENDATION: Move to approve a Resolution to Award the bid

to furnish Snow & Ice Control Products for

2017.

HANDLING: Return one (1) original to Public Works

ATTACHMENTS: Resolution; Bid Tab

LEAD STAFF: Mark R. Cook

Director of Public Works

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS COUNTY OF KITTITAS STATE OF WASHINGTON

RESOLUTION NO. 2016 -____

RESOLUTION TO AWARD THE BID TO FURNISH SNOW & ICE CONTROL PRODUCTS FOR 2017 AND AUTHORIZE THE PUBLIC WORKS DIRECTOR TO SIGN CONTRACT DOCUMENTS

WHEREAS:	A Notice of Call for Bids was approv furnish Snow & Ice Control Products	ed and signed on November 1, 2016, to for 2017; and
WHEREAS:	Sealed bids were opened on Novem County Public Works and six (6) bids	ber 17, 2016, at 2:00 p.m. in the Kittitas were received; and
WHEREAS:	Chloride; the responsible bid of Salt Inhibited Solid Sodium Chloride; the #4 – Non-Corrosion Inhibited Solid S	 Corrosion Inhibited Liquid Magnesium Distributors, Inc. for Item #3 – Corrosion responsible bid of Bob Rankin, LLC for Item Sodium Chloride; and the responsible bid of aver – Soil Stabilizer be accepted for Snow
WHEREAS:	Item #2 received no bids;	
interest of the Envirotech Se responsible bithe responsible Chloride; and upon such term BE IT FURTH contract documbidder(s).	public, does hereby award the bid for rvices Inc. for Item #1 — Corrosion Inled of Salt Distributors, Inc. for Item #3 e bid of Bob Rankin, LLC for Item #4 the responsible bid of RoadWise, Incoms and conditions as specified in the ER RESOLVED that the Director of F	pard of County Commissioners, in the best of 2017 Snow & Ice Control Products to hibited Liquid Magnesium Chloride; the — Corrosion Inhibited Solid Sodium Chloride; — Non-Corrosion Inhibited Solid Sodium of Item #5 — RoadSaver — Soil Stabilizer, Proposal submitted by said bidder(s). Public Works is authorized to sign the is specified in the Proposal submitted by said urg. Washington.
	,	BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
		KITTITAS COUNTY, WASHINGTON
Attest:		Obie O'Brien, Chairman
☐ Clerk of the	Board- Julie Kjorsvik	Paul Jewell, Vice-Chairman
□ Deputy Cle	rk of the Board- Mandy Buchholz	

Laura Osiadacz, Commissioner

	2017 Snow &	and Ice Control Proc	fucts, Nove	2017 Snow and Ice Control Products, November 17, 2016 @ 2:00 PM	PM								
		EnviroTech Services, Inc.	ices, Inc.	RoadWise, Inc.		Pioneer Commodities	dities	Bob Rankin, LLC	7200	Salt Distributors, Inc.	rs, Inc.	Morton Salt, Inc.	alt, Inc.
Item No.	o. Description	Product	Cost/Ton	Product	Cost/Ton	Product	Cost/Ton	Product	Cost/Ton	Product	Cost/Ton	Product	Cost/Ton
-	Corrosion Inhibited Liquid Magnesium Chloride	Melt Down Inhibited	\$166.75	FreezGard CI Plus	\$169.27	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00		\$0.00
2	Corrosion Inhibited Liquid Calcium Chloride	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00
က	Corrosion Inhibited Solid Sodium Chloride	Ice Slicer RS	\$159.33	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	Ice Kicker PNS 8C \$120.00	\$120.00	NO BID	\$0.00
4	Non Corrosion Inhibited Solid Sodium Chloride	Ice Slicer RS	\$159.33	White Road Salt	\$120.00	Non Corrosion Inhibited Solid Sodium Chloride	\$96.50	Non Corrosion Inhibited Solid Sodium Chloride Sodium Chloride Toduct is Type "C" Road Salt (this includes Mag Chloride and YPS)".	\$93.00	Qwiksalt RNS 8B	\$94.50	NO BID	\$0.00
S	RoadSaver - Soil Stabilizer	Road Saver - Soil Stabilizer	\$138.66	DustGard *#5 DustGard delivered to storage tanks at above delivery locations*	\$135.62	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00