EKITTITAS COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

e Kirk Holmes, Director

= —
HITTITAS COUNTY

MEMORANDUM

To: Neil Caulkins, DPA

From: Kirk Holmes, DP

Date; July 20, 2012

Subject: Bruce and Judy Montgomery Claims
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This memo serves as a response to the claim filed by Bruce and Judy Montgomery
dated July 11, 2012. The claim relates to an allegation of the over-charging of building
permiis.

Due to the tack of information and documentation provided for review in the claim,
specifically an amount allegedly overcharged, we are unable to respond to this claim.
Therefore we recommend a DENIAL of payment of this claim.

411 N. Ruby, Suite #1 TEL  (509) 9682-7523
Ellensburg, WA 98926 FAX  (505) 962-7663



EITTITAS COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

Kirk Holmes, Director

MEMORANDUM

To: Neil Caulkins, DPA

From: Kirk Holmes, DPW@

Date: July 20, 2012

Subject; Lance and Claudia Clawson Claim
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This memo serves as a response o your letter dated June 29, 2012 regarding our
departments review of the subject claim. The claim relates to an allegation of the over-
charging of building permits.

Due to the lack of information or documentation provided for review in the claim,
specifically an amount allegedly overcharged, we are unable fo respond to this claim.
Therefore we recommend a DENIAL of payment of this claim.

411 N. Ruby, Suite #1 TEL {609} 962-7523
Eflensburg, WA 98926 FAX {508} 962-7663



HBITTITAS COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

Kirk Holmes, Director

MEMORANDUM

To: " Neil Caulkins, DPA
From: Kirk Holmes, DPW @
Date: July 20, 2012

Subiect: Mitch Williams Claim
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This memo serves as a response to your letter dated June 15, 2012 regarding our
departments review of the subject claim. The claim relates to an allegation of the over
charging of building permits.

Due to the lack of information or documentation provided for review in the claim,
specifically an amount allegedly overcharged, we are unable {o respond o this claim.
Therefore we recommend a DENIAL of payment of this claim.

411 N. Ruby, Suite #1 TEL  (509) 962-7523
Ellenshurg, WA 98926 FAX  (509) 962-7663



