BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
COUNTY OF KITTITAS
STATE OF WASHINGTON

RESOLUTION

NO. aﬂﬁliwﬁ&’l&/?

RESOLUTION TO AWARD THE BID TO FURNISH
LIQUID ASPHALT MATERIALS FOR 2011

WHEREAS: A Notice of Call for Bids was approved and signed on February 1, 2011, to
furnish Liquid Asphalt Materials for 2011; and

WHEREAS: Sealed bids were opened on February 16, 2011, at 2:00 p.m. in the Kittitas
County Public Works Office, and three (3) bids were received; and

WHEREAS: The Public Works Department recommends that the responsible bid of Western
States Asphalt be accepted for Schedules “A” & “B”; and the responsible bid of
Albina Asphalt for Schedule “C” ; and

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of County Commissioners, in the best
interest of the public, does hereby award the bid for 2011 Liquid Asphalt Material to Western
States Asphalt for Schedules “A” and “B”; and the responsible bid of Albina Asphalt for
Schedule “C”, upon such terms and conditions as specified in the Proposal submitted by said
bidder(s).

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Public Works is authorized to sign the
contract documents upon such terms and conditions specified in the Proposal submitted by said
bidder(s).

DATED this 1 day of March, 2011, at Ellensburg, Washington.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
KITTITAS COUNTY, WASHINGTON
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2011 LIQUID ASPHALT
BID OPENING
FEBRURAY 16, 2011 @ 2:00

CRS-2P - Lo. County 2000 | Tons $508.00 $1,016,000.00 $586.00 $1,172,000.00 $615.00 $1,230,000.00
CRS-2P - Up.County 600 | Tons |  $508.00 $304,800.00 $586.00 $351,600.00 $615.00 $369,000.00
C88S150% Dil. - Lo. County 100 | Tons $329.00 $32,800.00 $441.00 $44,100.00 $415.00 $41,500.00
CSSi 50% Dil. - Up. County 50 Tons $329.00 $16,450.00 $441.00 $22,050.00 $415.00 $20,750.00
Haz. Sub. Tax- % - NA NA 0.700% $11,128.25 0.700% $11,628.75
WA St. Sales Tax- 8%- 8.00% $109,612.00 8.00% $127,180.00 8.00% $132,900.00
Total Schedule "A" - $1,479,762.00 $1,728,058.25 $1,805,778.75
CMS-2P - Lo. County 2000 | Tons $538.00 $1,076,000.00 $626.00 $1,252,000.00 No Bid $0.00
CMS-2P - Up. County 600 | Tons $538.00 $322,800.00 $626.00 $375,600.00 No Bid $0.00
CSSI 50% Dil. - Lo. County 100 | Tons $329.00 $32,900.00 $441.00 $44,100.00 No Bid $0.00
CSSI 50% Dil. - Up. County 50 | Tons $329.00 $16,450.00 $441.00 $22,050.00 No Bid $0.00
Haz. Sub. Tax- % - NA | 0.700% $11,856.25 0.700% $0.00
WA St. Sales Tax- Y%o- 8.00% $115,852.00 8.00% $135,500.00 8.20% $0.00
Total Schedule "B" - $1,564,002.00 $1,841,106.25 $0.00
HFR-SP1 - Lo. County 2000 | Tons No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $625.00 $1,250,000.00
HFR-SP1 - Up. County 600 | Tons No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $625.00 $375,000.00
HFR-SP1 50% Dil.-Lo. County 100 | Tons No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $425.00 $42,500.00
HFR-SP1 50% Dil.-Up. County 50 Tons No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $425.00 $21,250.00
Haz. Sub. Tax- % - 0.700% $0.00 0.007% $118.21
WA St Sales Tax- ____ %- 8.20% $0.00 8.00% $135,100.00
Total Schedule "C" - $0.00 $0.00 $1,823,968.21




