BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
COUNTY OF KITTITAS
STATE OF WASHINGTON

RESOLUTION

No. 2004~ o,

TO AWARD THE BID TO FURNISH PETROLEUM AND LUBRICANT PRODUCTS FOR 2010 AND
AUTHORIZE THE PUBLIC WORKS DIRECTOR TO SIGN CONTRACT DOCUMENTS

WHEREAS:

WHEREAS:

WHEREAS:

WHEREAS:

A Notice of Call for Bids was advertised for Petroleum and Lubricant Products for 2010 on
November 17, 2009; and

Sealed bids were opened on December 2, 2009, at 2:00 p.m. in the Kittitas County Public
Works and three (3) bids were received; and

The Public Works Department recommends that the responsible bids of A-1 Petroleum for
Schedule “A”; and Wondrack Distributing for Schedule “D” be accepted; and

No bids were received for Schedules “B” & “C", so other alternatives will be sought for
these products.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of County Commissioners, in the best interest of the
public, does hereby award the bid for 2010 Fuel to A-1 Petroleum for Schedule “A”; and Wondrack
Distributing for Schedule “D”, upon such terms and conditions as specified in the Proposal submitted by

said bidder(s).

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Public Works is authorized to sign the contract
documents upon such terms and conditions specified in the Proposal submitted by said bidder(s).

DATED this 15t day of December, 2009, at Ellensburg, Washington.
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G:\Admin\Bidding Documents-Materials & Equip\Road Materials Bid Documents\Materials Bid Documents\2010
Materials Bid Specs-Documents\Petro-Lubricant\Petrol.ubeBidTabs08.x|s

WEEKOF: ' ' ''30-Nov-09 . ' ' OpIS#rii28 ' 2010A-1 PETROLEUMSCH'A* . ..
Tesoro
Unleaded Mid Unleaded Prem. Unleaded
OPISPad | . 2.0450 24350 22280 0.0000
007 Haz.Tax | 0.0143 00149 00156 0.0000
ProfitMargin __ | 01800 _  _ 0.1800 _ 01800 0.0000
Gas Tax | - 0.3750 03750 _0.3750| - _0.0000
Federal Tax 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.000E
Subtotal [ 2613 27048 27956| 0.0000
Sales Tax . . . 0ooool  o0ooc0l 0.0000f 0.0000
Less Fed. Tax 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000
Total 2.6143 2.7049 2.7956 0.0000
Tesoro (U) DIESEL (vor BLENDED) Tesoro (U) BLEND

Diesel No. 2 Low Sulfer Blended Diesel
[oPiS Pad Lo Sulf #2 | TEXACO (u) -Lo Sulfer #2 | TESORO (u)-Lo Sulfer#2 0.0000
OPISPadloSulf#d | L - | SHELL (U) -Lo Sulfer #1_ 0.0000
subtotal (Sum/Div. By 2 for per gal price) 0.0000§
DIESELFUEL#2 | __2025( | 50/50PRICE PER GAL _0.0000
.007 Haz. Tax_ a ~_0.0103] L o = e 0.0000
ProfitMargin | om0 o f. B 0.0000!
Gas Tax 0.0000 0.0000
Subtotal ) 22128 | R _ 0.0000
Sales Tax 7.7% 0.1304 0.0000
Total 2.3432 0.0000
invoice Adj. To
Balance - Less Fed.
Tax /per gal. 0.0000 0.0000

SCHEDULE "C” T

TEXACO RED #1 Stove ONLY - Upper

Qil Diesel County
Stove Oil #1 ~0.0000 NO BID
.007 Haz. Tax 0.0000 NO BID .
Profit Margin 0.0000 NO BID
Subtotal 0.0000 NO BID
Sales Tax 0.0000 NO BID
Total 0.0000 NO BID 0.0000 0.0000




2010 LUBRICANTS BID FOR KITTITAS COUNTY

Item Plan o Prices A1 Prices | Midstate | Prices
No. |Quantity ewm: Deniripton Per Unit | Petroleum | Per Unit | Co-Op | Per Unit Weandrck
Motor Oll, API Service Class CF4, CC,
D1 400 Gallons SE, SD, SF SAE Multi- grade 15-40
= SSqakanidmims $0.85 | $3.940.00 | $10.03 | $4,012.00 | $742 | $2,968.00
Motor Qil, API Service Class CF4, CC,
D-2 800 Gallons SE, SD, SF SAE Multi- grade 15-40
i EULIS DELIVERY) $8.89 | $5334.00 | $844 |$5064.00 | s7.42 | $4,452.00
Tractor Hydraulic oil
D3 500 e (JD Cat Specifications)
$10.37 | $5,185.00 $9.56 $4,780.00 | $8.04 | $4,020.00
Hydraulic Oll, GMA Lubricant, Grade 68
D-3 220 (Selons 55 gallon drums
$8.64 $1,900.80 $7.79 $1,713.80 $6.54‘+ $1,438.80
Motor Qil
D-4 110  |Gallons API Service Class CC, SE, SAE-10
55 gallon drums $9.85 | $1,08460 | sse7 | $953.70 | s$982 | $1,080.20
Universal Gear Lubricant SAE
D-5A 400 [Pounds | Grade BOW-90, API Service Class GL-5,
120b. B $11.85 | $4,740.00 | $11.14 | $4,456.00| s$170 | $680.00
Unlversal Gear Lubricant SAE
D-5B 105 |Pounds | Grade 80W-20, AP| Service Class GL-5,
SIS T $1127 | $1,183.35 | s1074 | $1,127.70| $173 | $181.66
Automatic Transmission Fiuid, Type F
D-6 126  |Gallons 55 gallon drums
$16.88 $2,126.88 $9.51 $1,198.26 | $10.71 $1,349.46
D-7 165  |Gallons Antifreeze - 55 gallon drums
$9.00 $1,485.00 $8.21 $1,354.65 $6.69 $1,103.85
$26,979.63 $24,660.11 $17,273.96
Tax- 8.00% $2,158.37 8.00% | $1,97281] 8.00% | $1,381.92
Total of Schedule "D" - $29,138.00 $26,632.92 $18,655.88







