KITTITAS COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

AGENDA DATE:

ACTION REQUESTED:

AGENDA STAFF REPORT

March 2, 2010

Approve a Resolution to Award the Bid to
furnish Liquid Asphalt Materials for Calendar
Year 2010.

BACKGROUND:

INTERACTION:

RECOMMENDATION:

HANDLING:

ATTACHMENTS:

LEAD STAFF:

Annually, Kittitas County Public Works goes
out to bid for the furnishing of Liquid Asphalt
Materials in accordance with Standard
Specifications of the Washington State
Department of Transportation. Call for bids are
advertised in the legal newspaper and bid
packets are sent out to all local businesses in
order to provide equal opportunity.

Bids were opened on February 17, 2010, at
2:00 p.m. in the Public Works Department.
Three bids were received and deemed
responsive.

Public Works

Move to approve the Resolution to Award the
Bid to furnish Liquid Asphalt Materials for 2010
to Western States Asphalt, Inc. for Schedules

‘A’ and '‘B’; and to Albina Asphalt for Schedule
‘C.

Return one (1) original to Public Works

Resolution; Bid Tab

Kirk Holmes
Director of Public Works



BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
COUNTY OF KITTITAS
STATE OF WASHINGTON

RESOLUTION

NO.

RESOLUTION TO AWARD THE BID TO FURNISH
LIQUID ASPHALT MATERIALS FOR 2010

WHEREAS: A Notice of Call for Bids was approved and signed on February 2, 2010, to
furnish Ligquid Asphalt Materials for 2010; and

WHEREAS: Sealed bids were opened on February 17, 2010, at 2:00 p.m. in the Kittitas
County Public Works Office, and three (3) bids were received; and

WHEREAS: The Public Works Department recommends that the responsible bid of Western
States Asphalt be accepted for Schedules “A” & “B”; and the responsible bid of
Albina Asphalt for Schedule “C” ; and

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of County Commissioners, in the best
interest of the public, does hereby award the bid for 2010 Liquid Asphalt Material to Western
States Asphalt for Schedules “A” and “B”; and the responsible bid of Albina Asphalt for
Schedule “C”, upon such terms and conditions as specified in the Proposal submitted by said
bidder(s).

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Director of Public Works is authorized to sign the
contract documents upon such terms and conditions specified in the Proposal submitted by said
bidder(s).

DATED this 2™ day of March, 2010, at Ellensburg, Washington.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
KITTITAS COUNTY, WASHINGTON

Mark McClain, Chair
Attest:

Paul Jewell, Vice-Chair

Clerk of the Board

Alan Crankovich, Commissioner



2010 LIQUID ASPHALT
BID OPENING
FEBRURAY 17, 2010 @ 2:00

Western States Asphalt, Inc Idaho Asphalt Supply Albina Asphalt
Product aty. 4327 N. Thor. St. P.O. Box 50538 801 Main St.
Spokane, WA 99217 Idaho Falls, ID 83405 Vancouver, WA 98660
(509) 487-4560 (208) 524-5871 (360) 816-8072
CRS-2P - Lo. County 500 | Tons | $574.00 $287,000.00 - $589.00 $294,500.00 $632.50 $316,250.00
CRS-2P - Up. County 300 | Tons | $574.00 $172,200.00 $589.00 $176,700.00 $632.50 $189,750.00
CSS150% Dil. - Lo. County 100 | Tons | $415.00 $41,500.00 $429.00 $42,900.00 $462.50 |  $46,250.00
CS8I150% Dil. - Up. County 50 Tons | $415.00 $20,750.00 $429.00 $21,450.00 $462.50 $23,125.00
Haz. Sub. Tax-___ %- NA 0.700% |  $3,748.85 | 0.700% |  $4,027.63
WA St. Sales Tax- ____%- 8.00% $41,716.00 8.00% $42,844.00 8.00% $46,030.00
Total Schedule "A" - $563,166.00 $582,142.85 $625,432.63
CMS-2P - Lo. County 500 | Tons| $608.00 $304,000.00 $619.00 $309,500.00 No Bid 000
CMS-2P - Up. County 300 | Tons | $608.00 $182,400.00 $619.00 $185,700.00 No Bid $0.00
CSS1 50% Dil. - Lo. County 100 | Tons | $415.00 $41,500.00 $429.00 $42,900.00 No Bid $0.00
CSS150% Dil. - Up. County 50 Tons | $415.00 $20,750.00 $429.00 $21,450.00 No Bid $0.00
Haz. Sub. Tax-___ %- NA 0.700% $3,916.85 0.700% $0.00
WA St. Sales Tax- %- 8.00% $43,892.00 8.00% $44,764.00 8.20% $0.00
Total Schedule "B" - $592,542.00 $608,230.85 $0.00
HFR-SP1 - Lo. County 500 | Tons| No Bid $0.00 ~No Bid $0.00 $632.50 $316,250.00
HFR-SP1 - Up. County 300 | Tons| No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $632.50 $189,750.00
HFR-3P1 50% Dil.-Lo. County | 100 | Tons | NoBid - $0.00 No Bid | $0.00 $462.50 $46,250.00
HFR-SP1 50% Dil.-Up. County 50 Tons | No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $462.50 $23,125.00
Haz. Sub. Tax-____ %-| | 0.700% $0.00 0.700% $4,027.63
WA St. Sales Tax- _____%- 8.20% $0.00 8.00% $46,030.00

Total Schedule "C" $0.00 $0.00 $625,432.63




